
Banana Nut Muffin: Sugar, enriched WHEAT flour bleached (WHEAT flour, niacin, iron, thiamin mononitrate, riboflavin, folic 
acid), modified food starch, SOYBEAN oil, defatted SOY flour, EGGS, leavening (baking soda, sodium aluminum phosphate), 
mono- and diglycerides, natural and artificial flavor, propylene glycol mono- and diester of fatty acids, salt, sodium stearoyl 
lactylate, vital WHEAT GLUTEN, WHEY, banana puree (bananas, citric acid, ascorbic acid), water, WALNUTS, sour CREAM 
(cultured CREAM, modified corn starch, sodium phosphate, carrageenan, calcium sulfate, carob bean gum, guar gum, 
potassium sorbate), banana emulsion (water, propylene glycol, xanthan gum, natural and artificial banana flavor, citric acid), 
cinnamon, vanilla emulsion (propylene glycol, corn syrup, vanillin, ethyl vanillin). Contains: Eggs, Milk, Soy, Wheat.

Belgian Waffle: WHEAT flour, vegetable margarine (rspo palm oil, rapeseed oil, sunflower oil, water, emulsifier mono and 
diglycerides of fatty acids, sunflower lecithin, salt, acidifier acid citric, natural flavors), pearl sugar, EGGS, invert sugar, yeast, 
MILK powder, vanillin. Contains: Eggs, Milk, Wheat

Cinnamon Crumb Cake Muffin: Sugar, enriched WHEAT flour bleached (WHEAT flour, niacin, iron, thiamin mononitrate, 
riboflavin, folic acid), modified food starch, SOYBEAN oil, defatted SOY flour, EGGS, leavening (baking soda, sodium aluminum 
phosphate), mono- and diglycerides, natural and artificial flavor, propylene glycol mono- and diester of fatty acids, salt, sodium 
stearoyl lactylate, vital WHEAT GLUTEN, WHEY, brown sugar, water, unbleached enriched WHEAT flour (WHEAT flour, 
malted BARLEY flour, and folic acid), enriched cake flour (WHEAT flour, reduced iron, butter (CREAM, natural flavors), 
shortening (palm oil and SOY oil), cinnamon, vanilla emulsion (propylene glycol, corn syrup, vanillin, ethyl vanillin), cocoa 
powder. Contains: Eggs, Milk, Soy, Wheat

Sausage Egg and Cheese Burrito: Flour tortilla (WHEAT flour, water, canola oil, oat fiber, vital WHEAT GLUTEN, cane sugar, 
cultured WHEAT flour, salt, distilled monoglyceride, malic acid, baking soda, cellulose gum, guar gum, sodium acid 
pyrophosphate, niacin, reduced iron, thiamin mononitrate, riboflavin, folic acid), scrambled EGGS (whole EGGS, modified 
tapioca starch, corn oil, citric acid, vegetable gum), cooked spicy breakfast sausage (pork, sugar, spices, natural flavoring), 
potatoes, sharp cheddar cheese (pasteurized MILK, cheese culture, enzymes, annatto, cellulose powder), cooked onions, 
natural flavors, modified food starch, spice, sea salt. Contains: Eggs, Milk, Wheat.

Triple Latte: Reduced fat MILK, coffee (water, coffee), cane sugar, chicory root fiber, acacia, disodium phosphate, trisodium 
phosphate, lactase enzyme, rosemary extract, gellan gum, vitamin d3. Contains: Milk.

Turkey Sausage and Cheese Egg Bites: EGGS, half & half (MILK, CREAM), cheese blend (cheddar cheese (pasteurized 
MILK, cheese cultures, salt, enzymes and annatto (for color)), gouda cheese (pasteurized MILK, havarti cheese (pasteurized 
MILK, enzymes), swiss cheese (pasteurized MILK, powdered cellulose (to prevent caking)), fully cooked breakfast sausage 
(turkey thigh, water, spices, sugar), onion, expeller pressed canola oil, corn starch, garlic, sea salt, lemon juice, seasoning 
(rosemary, oregano, sage, ginger, marjoram, thyme, pepper), xanthan gum. Contains: Eggs, Milk.
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